[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item

Description

Current Model
Year, Or
Newer Ford
F550 Regular
Cab With
Platform Body,
As Specified or
Equal

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

$79,229.00

$1,584,580.00

No Bid

Year/Mfr./Make/Model:

Delivery,
AR.O.:

Warranty
Details:

3-year 36,000
bumper to
bumper//s-
year 100,000
powertrain

Comments:

OPTIONS

4A

Upgrade
chassis to
Super Cab
chassis,
retaining 60"
Cab to Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$1,800.00

$36,000.00

48

Upgrade
chassis to
Crew Cab
chassis,
retaining 60"
Cab to Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$3,300.00

$66,000.00

ac

Upgrade to
Regular Cab
chassis with
84" Cab to
Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$300.00

$6,000.00
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item

Description

Upgrade to
Super Cab
chassis with
84" Cab to
Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

Quantity

Unit of
Measure

EA

Unit Cost

$300.00

Total

$6,000.00

Year/Mfr./Make/Model:

Warranty Comments:
Details:

4€

Upgrade to
Crew Cab
chassis with
84" Cab to
Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$300.00

$6,000.00

4F

Upgrade to
Regular Cab
chassis with
108" Cab to
Axle, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$900.00

$18,000.00

Upgrade to
12'3" Platform
Body with
Removable
Stake for use
with 84" CA
Chassis, As
Specified or
Equal

20

EA

$6,312.00

$126,240.00

Thieman TT
Liftgate, As
Specified or

- | Equal

20

EA

$6,100.00

$122,000.00
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Year/Mfr./Make/Model: Delivery, Warranty Comments:

Measure AR.O.: Details:

4l Thieman Stow- 20 EA $7,905.00 $158,100.00
Away Standard
Tailgate

v Liftgate, As
Specified or
Equal

4] Under Body 20 EA $11,078.00 $221,560.00
Hoist far

/ Dumping

9% Capabilities, As
Specified or
Equal

4K Dump- 20 EA $9,575.00 $191,500.00
/ Through
U 4 Liftgate, As
Specified or
Equal

4L 40" Stake 20 EA $4,421.00 $88,420.00
- Sides (9'3"”
/ Body), As
/ 1
A Specified or
| Equal

iM 40" Stake 20 EA $6,500.00 $130,000.00
S/ Sides (123" |
/ Body), As
Specified or
Equal

/A-N Color Option 20 : EA $1,670.00 $33,400.00
P 4 for 40" Stake
L Sides, As
Specified or
Equal
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Year/Mfr./Make/Model: Delivery, Warranty Comments:

Measure A.R.O.: Details:

40 52" Stake 20 EA $6,130.00° | $122,600.00
Sides (8'3"
Body), As
Specified or
Equal

4p 52" Stake 20 EA $6,521.00 $130,420.00
Sides (12'3”
Body), As
Specified or
Equal

4Q Color Option 20 EA $1,670.00 $33,400.00
for 52" Stake
/ :
\ Sides, As
Specified or
Equal

4R 40" Grain 20 EA $3,539.00 $70,780.00
/- Sides (9'3"
Body), As
Specified or
Equal

45 40" Grain 20 EA $3,995.00 $79,500.00
p Sides (12'3”
i Body), As
Specified or
Equal

P Color Option 20 EA 51,670.00 $33,400.00
for 40” Grain
A Sides, As
Specified or
Equal
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Year/Mfr./Make/Model: Delivery, Warranty Comments:

Measure A.R.O.: Details:

4U 52" Grain 20 EA $6,007.00 $120,140.00
/ Sides (9'3"
/ Body), As -
Specified or
Equal

4 52" Grain 20 EA $6,533.00 $130,660.00

Sides (12'3”
; Body), As
Vv Specified or
Equal

4w Color Option 20 EA $1,670.00 $33,400.00

/ for 52” Grain
% Sides, As
Specified or
Equal

4x Light Package 20 EA $2,794.00 $55,880.00
1, As Specified ’
or Equal

2, As Specified
or Equal

47 Go Light Work 20 EA $4,156.00 $83,120.00
Lights, Model
30004ST, As
Specified or
Equal

/ ay Light Package 20 EA $3,368.00 $67,360.00

/AA |-Pack Tool 20 EA $5,375.00 | $107,500.00
Box, As

V| Specified or
Equal
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Year/Mfr./Make/Madel: Delivery, Warranty Comments:

Measure AR.O.: Details:

4BB 30" Under 20 EA $1,593.00 $31,860.00

Body Tool Box,
W As Specified or
‘ Equal

acc 48" Under 20 EA $1,941.00 $38,820.00
yd Body Tool Box,
| 4 As Specified or
Equal

4DD Air 20 EA $16,296.00 | $325,920.00
/ Compressor,
\J 70 CFM, As

Specified or
Equal

4EE Air 20 EA $20,713.00 5414,260.00
Compressor,
7 150 CFM, As
N\ Specified or
Equal

AFF Whelen LED 20 EA $5,473.00 $109,460.00
L/ 54" Light Bar,
As Specified or
Equal

4GG 9’ Readily 20 EA $7,821.00 $156,420.00
¥ Detachable

/ Western Snow
\J Plow System,
As Specified or
Equal

AHH Trailblazer 325 20 EA $36,095.00 $721,900.00
Air Pak, As

Specified or
Equal
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD :
MOTOR VEHICLES: VARIOUS BODIED HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Year/Mfr./Make/Model: Delivery, Warranty Comments:
Measure A.R.O.: Details:

Slide Bar with -
/ Straps, As

o Specified or
Equal

EA $1,164.00 $23,280.00

4]) Stainless Steel 20 EA $49,120.00 $982,400.00
V-Box,

// Hydraulically
i L/ Operated
Hydraulics, As
Specified or
Equal

4KK Diagnostic 3 SET $9,500.00 $28,500.00
A Tools [ Test
\/ Equipment, As
Specified

4LL Two-Way 20 EA $344.00 $6,880.00
Radio Power
\/ / and Wiring
Requirements
for New
Vehicle, As .
Specified

4MM Installation of .20 EA $1,350.00 $27,000.00

County
Supplied Two

‘\// Way Radio and

Accessories,

As Specified

/WN Technical 180 HOUR $175.00 $31,500.00
Support, As
Specified

TOTAL $6,760,560.00
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